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ASSOCIATE
D 267.948.2611
F 610.667.7056

velangovan@ktmc.com

FOCUS AREAS
Securities Fraud 

Corporate Governance & M+A 

Global Shareholder Litigation

Healthcare Impact & Consumer Protection

Whistleblower 

Direct & Opt-Out

Antitrust 

Banking & Financial Services 

EDUCATION
DePaul University
BSc Finance, 2015, summa cum laude 

Georgetown University Law Center
J.D., 2022

ADMISSIONS
New York

Pennsylvania

Texas

Varun Elangovan, an associate of the Firm, focuses his practice on 
Global Securities Litigation. His experience includes pre-suit 
investigations with a specific focus on analyzing securities, 
antitrust, and consumer class action lawsuits. He also has 
experience litigating complex antitrust and consumer protection 
actions on behalf of individuals and businesses affected by 
anticompetitive practices, defective products, or improper business 
conduct.

In addition, Varun worked extensively on behalf of self-insured 
health plans in novel constitutional claims against the U.S. 
Government, challenging the requirement to contribute to the 
Affordable Care Act’s Transitional Reinsurance Program. He played 
a key role in the damages phase of the litigation, which resulted in 
a $169 million settlement—one of the largest ever obtained in 
cases brought before the Court of Federal Claims.

Varun received his J.D. from Georgetown University Law Center 
and his undergraduate degree from DePaul University. While at 
Georgetown Law, he served as an Executive Online Editor for The 
Georgetown Law Journal.
 

Publications
 Note, Hacking Through the Jungle: Taking a Machete to the 

Admissibility Jungle of Deferred Prosecution Agreements, 42 
Rev. Litig. 217 (2022)

 Mixed Emotions: How Lower Courts Misconstrue TransUnion 
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and Have Since Created a New Judicially Cognizable Injury for 
Stand-Alone Emotional Distress, NEB. L. REV. BULL. (Nov. 16, 
2022), https://lawreview.unl.edu/mixed-emotions-how-lower-
courts-misconstrue-transunion-and-have-created-new-
judicially-cognizable
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